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Cultural Identity Tree
Instructions: Draw your own cultural identity tree, then use the suggestions below 

to write down and include different parts of your identity in your artwork.

Sky: what you are grateful for 
(people, things, places, etc)

Fruit: your major 
accomplishments, gifts people 
have given you (e.g., support 
and kindness) and gifts you’ve 
given to others, traditions that 
inspire you

Leaves: what you love about 
yourself, what you are most 
proud of, how others would 
describe your strengths

Branches: your hopes and 
dreams, new directions that 
you would like to take, such 
as how you would like to 
help your family, school, and 
community

Trunk: who you are in this 
world, your personality and 
interests, a fun fact about you

Ground: what gives you joy 
and hope, what you do in 
everyday life (at school, home, 
or with friends)

Roots: your name and where 
you come from, the name of 
your city/town, traditions that 
are important to you and your 
loved ones


